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Dr. Nikhil Kumar Rajput, doctorate in Computer Science from Jawaharlal Nehru
University, New Delhi is currently associated with Ramanujan College in the
capacity of Assistant Professor, Department of Computer Science and Deputy
Director of the Teaching Learning Centre, Ramanujan College. He has also been
the Coordinator for the National Resource Centre which was awarded to
Ramanujan College under the Ministry of Education. In 2015, Dr. Rajput
represented University of Delhi in West College, Scotland, under the UK India
Education Research Initiative (UKIERI) project. He was among nineteen
delegates selected by TAFE, Australian to visit Canberra under Australia-India
VELT program, 2017.

Dr. Rajput’s research interests range from Stochastic Modeling, Machine
Learning, Image Processing to Computational Linguistics, Robotics, and
Blockchain. Not only he has a number of publications to his credit, but he has also
been a valuable resource person invited as resource person for various training
workshops/seminars in a number of institutions including AIIMS(Delhi), South
Asian University, Mumbai University, HRDC Pune University, Assam University,
Jesus Mary College, Daulat Ram College, Lady Shri Ram College and others.
He has convened and coordinated more than 90 National Faculty Enrichment
Programs and has also acted as advisory and technical committee member for
several international conferences. Dr. Rajput has to his credit a major project
from the Department of Science and Technology, Government of India for
building a solution for ‘Interactive and Immersive framework for Cultural
heritage sites.’


